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RE: Brunsting - 2017 1st Qtr Accounting Summary

From: Stephen A. Mendel (steve@mendellawfirm.com)
To:  cbrunsting@sbcglobal.net; occurtis@sbcglobal.net; nspielman@grifmatlaw.com
Cc. tim@mendellawfirm.com; nancy@mendellawfirm.com

Date: Friday, May 12, 2017, 2:20 PM PDT

Carole:

You should hire an attorney, so he or she can explain to you the procedural status of the two
federal cases, as well as the probate court case, and why your interruption, as listed below, is in error.

Have a nice weekend.

Very truly yours,

Stephen A. Mendel

The Mendel Law Firm, L.P.
1155 Dairy Ashford, Suite 104
Houston, TX 77079

0O: 281-759-3213

F: 281-759-3214

steve(@mendellawfirm.com

CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION: The information contained in this e-mail from The Mendel Law Firm, L.P.,
is confidential, privileged, and protected from disclosure. Such information is intended only for the use by the
individual(s) or entity named on the above recipient list. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us by telephone.
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From: Carole Brunsting [mailto:cbrunsting@sbcglobal.net]
Sent: Friday, May 12, 2017 3:55 PM

To: Stephen A. Mendel; 'Candace Curtis'; 'Neal Spielman’
Cc: Timothy J. Jadloski; NM/MLF

Subject: Re: Brunsting - 2017 1st Qtr Accounting Summary

Stephen

I wanted to follow up with you on the distribution of my inheritance. I provided a copy of the injunction that was signed
by Judge Hoyt stating that any income received for the benefit of the Trust beneficiary is to be deposited appropriately in
an account. Because has not been done according to what was signed by Judge Hoyt, the trust has been forced to pay

taxes of $99K because the money was not distributed as ordered. Please let me know when my account will be funded
according to the injunction signed by Federal Court Judge Hoyt.

Also, I wanted to point out that I have asked for but not yet received a list of the incurred debt that you made reference to
or monies owed from family members.

Per Article X of the First Amendment to the Brunsting Family Living Trust:

Section A. Outstanding Indebtedness of a Beneficiary

Upon the death of the surviving Founder, any amount due and owing by Anita Kay Riley which is secured by a lien
against real property shall be forgiven and such amount shall constitute a portion of the trust share of Anita Kay Riley, as
set forth in the Sections of this Article which follow.

According to the statement above I believe this to mean that the $100,000 that was given to Anita by our parents to pay off
her house is now considered a portion of her trust share. If you need a copy Article X I can forward one to you.

I look forward to hearing from you.

Carole

On Tuesday, May 2, 2017 6:58 PM, Stephen A. Mendel <steve@mendellawfirm.com> wrote:

To All:
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We forward for your files the accounting summary through the 15T Quarter 2017.

Very truly yours,

Stephen A. Mendel

The Mendel Law Firm, L.P.
1155 Dairy Ashford, Suite 104
Houston, TX 77079

0O: 281-759-3213

F: 281-759-3214

steve(@mendellawfirm.com

CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION: The information contained in this e-mail from The Mendel Law
Firm, L.P., is confidential, privileged, and protected from disclosure. Such information is intended
only for the use by the individual(s) or entity named on the above recipient list. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify
us by telephone.
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