

MacIntyre McCulloch Stanfield Young, LLP

2900 Wesleyan, Suite 150
Houston, Texas 77027

Ph:713.572.2900
Fax:713.572.2902

Tax ID No: 76-0847361

November 16, 2015

JWY

Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending Cor
P.O. Box 79766
Houston, Texas 77279

Inv #: 13157

Client #: 101209

Matter #: 002006

Bill Through Date 10 /31/15

RE: Brunsting, Estate of Nelva E

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Aug-31-15	Lengthy telephone conversation with Greg Lester; review various dockets in matter and documents forwarded by Mr. Lester.	1.00	350.00	JWY
Sep-01-15	Receipt and review of correspondence; review orders; meeting with Greg Lester to discuss case and how to proceed; memo on documents that need to be prepared and filed.	1.70	595.00	JWY
	Obtained initial information on this matter from Jill Young.	0.50	112.50	AAG
Sep-02-15	Memo on various items; review file; work on procedural matters including moving hearings and trial setting in district court; correspond regarding court hearings set and moving of trial date.	1.70	595.00	JWY
	Receipt and review of Order Appointing Temporary Administrator; attention to Entry of Appearance and Motion for Continuance; begin review of district court filings and attention to upcoming settings; telephone conversation with Neal Spielman; memo to file regarding same	2.50	562.50	AAG
Sep-03-15	Review correspondence; update regarding same.	0.20	70.00	JWY

EXHIBIT "A2"

	Draft Entry of Appearance and Motion for Continuance; review and revise same; receipt and review of memorandum regarding status and attention to hearing setting	1.20	270.00	AAG
Sep-04-15	Correspondence to Greg Lester on status.	0.50	175.00	JWY
	Review and revise Motion for Continuance and Entry of Appearance and attention to setting to continue summary judgment in district court proceedings; receipt of memorandum to client; attention to hearing setting on Application to Retain Counsel and Notice regarding same	0.70	157.50	AAG
Sep-08-15	Follow-up on Motion with Greg Lester and the hearing for application.	0.50	175.00	JWY
	Attention to upcoming hearing on Application to Retain Counsel and notice to counsel regarding same; receipt and review of call from Mr. Neal Spielman	0.40	90.00	AAG
Sep-09-15	Telephone conversation with Neal Spielman; attention to hearing on Application to Retain Counsel; receipt and review of memorandum to Greg Lester; receipt and review of correspondence from opposing parties to Court; attention to Response filed to Application to Retain Counsel; conference with Jill Young	0.80	180.00	AAG
Sep-10-15	Telephone call and correspondence to Greg Lester regarding hearing and matter for Friday.	0.20	70.00	JWY
	Receipt and review of Response to Application to Retain Counsel; telephone conversation with Greg Lester; memorandum to Jill Young	0.50	112.50	AAG
Sep-11-15	Receipt and review of Order Allowing Administrator to Retain Counsel; exchange of correspondence with Greg Lester; memorandum to file regarding fee standards	0.50	112.50	AAG
Sep-14-15	Review Order; conference regarding same; document review from client; advise Adri Graves on how to proceed.	0.50	175.00	JWY
Sep-17-15	Receipt and review of correspondence from parties regarding pleadings; advise Adri Graves on plan for proceeding with the documents; correspondence to parties.	0.80	280.00	JWY

	Attention to compiling pleadings and documents received from counsel; draft correspondence to all counsel regarding litigation and requesting documents; docket deadlines for expiration of temporary administration and report deadlines	0.60	135.00	AAG
Sep-18-15	Attention to pleadings for review of claims in this litigation	0.30	67.50	AAG
Sep-21-15	Receipt and review of correspondence; respond to various emails.	0.30	105.00	JWY
Sep-22-15	Review e-mail correspondence from party; finalize correspondence.	0.30	105.00	JWY
	Continue to review pleadings and pertinent discovery in District Court cause; receipt and review of chronology from Candace Curtis	0.50	112.50	AAG
Sep-24-15	Receipt and review of correspondence and documents from parties in matter; initial review of documents; advise Adri on how to proceed and review of information.	0.80	280.00	JWY
	Receipt and review of correspondence and documents from Candace Curtis' legal assistant;	0.20	45.00	AAG
Sep-25-15	Review relevant District Court pleadings, discovery and documents; prepare memorandum regarding same; attention to review of trust documents and identification of same	1.50	337.50	AAG
Sep-28-15	Receipt and review of additional documents; telephone conversation with Bobbie Bayless regarding documents.	0.80	280.00	JWY
Sep-29-15	Receipt and review of correspondence from parties; follow-up on same.	0.30	105.00	JWY
Sep-30-15	Continue extensive review of Trust materials and prepare memorandums regarding same	2.40	540.00	AAG
Oct-01-15	Receipt and review of correspondence.	0.20	70.00	JWY
Oct-02-15	Continue extensive review of trust documents and pleadings asserting claims in this matter; review and revise memorandums regarding same	3.00	675.00	AAG
Oct-14-15	Conference on documents; review additional correspondence.	0.70	245.00	JWY

Invoice #: 13157

Page 4

November 16, 2015

Nov-16-15 Professional discount

-350.00

JWY

Totals

26.10

\$6,835.00

DISBURSEMENTS

Sep-01-15 Photocopies
eFiling with the court
Sep-04-15 eFiling with the court

10.00

6.17

2.06

Totals

\$18.23

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$6,853.23

Balance Now Due

\$6,853.23

FEE SUMMARY

JWY \$350.00

10.50 \$3,325.00

AAG \$225.00

15.60 \$3,510.00

UNOFFICIAL COPY

MacIntyre McCulloch Stanfield Young, LLP

2900 Wesleyan, Suite 150
Houston, Texas 77027

Ph:713.572.2900
Fax:713.572.2902

Tax ID No: 76-0847361

February 10, 2016

JWY

Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending Cor
P.O. Box 79766
Houston, Texas 77279

Inv #: 13598

Client #: 101209

Matter #: 002006

Bill Through Date 01 /31/16

RE: Brunsting, Estate of Nelva E

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
Dec-03-15	Review status of report for Mr. Lester; telephone call to Greg Lester on various topics; correspond regarding same.	0.80	280.00	JWY
Dec-15-15	Continue to review pertinent trust documents and pleadings, revise and prepare memorandums	1.40	315.00	AAG
Dec-16-15	Status update on report; correspond regarding same.	0.30	105.00	JWY
	Telephone conversation with Greg Lester; exchange of correspondence with Alec Covey regarding status; continue to review documents and prepare memorandums regarding same	2.20	495.00	AAG
Dec-17-15	Attention to preparing documents for Greg Lester	0.20	45.00	AAG
Dec-21-15	Receipt and review of message from Greg Lester; attention to scheduling meeting with Mr. Lester and preparation of memorandums	0.20	45.00	AAG
Dec-22-15	Meeting with Greg Lester regarding report	0.50	112.50	AAG
Dec-23-15	Continue to work on report and draft of same	0.40	90.00	AAG
Dec-24-15	Continue to draft memo to Administrator for report	0.50	112.50	AAG

Dec-28-15	Continue to work on Brunsting memorandum for Temporary Administrator	3.00	675.00	AAG
Jan-04-16	Continue to review and revise memorandum regarding evaluation of claims for Temporary Administrator	0.70	157.50	AAG
Jan-05-16	Continue to review pleadings filed in both the Probate and District Court case; review and revise memorandum to Temporary Adminsitator regarding claims; telephone conversation with Temporary Administrator and correspondence to same enclosing draft memorandums	1.80	405.00	AAG
Jan-11-16	Review of draft memo for report; follow-up on same.	0.80	280.00	JWY
	Draft correspondence to Greg Lester; receipt and review of message from Mr. Lester; review No Contest Clause provisions in Trust Agreements and documents; telephone conversation with Mr. Lester regarding same	1.20	270.00	AAG
Jan-18-16	Receipt and review of filed Report of Temporary Administrator	0.40	90.00	AAG
Jan-19-16	Status conference regarding filing of Report; correspond regarding various topics.	0.20	70.00	JWY
Jan-21-16	Telephone conversation with Neal Spielman regarding Temporary Administrator's Report and potential mediators	0.20	45.00	AAG
	Totals	14.80	<u>\$3,592.50</u>	

Total Fee & Disbursements

\$3,592.50

Previous Balance

6,853.23

Balance Now Due

\$10,445.73

FEE SUMMARY

JWY	\$350.00	2.10	\$735.00
AAG	\$225.00	12.70	\$2,857.50

MacIntyre McCulloch Stanfield Young, LLP
 2900 Wesleyan, Suite 150
 Houston, Texas 77027

Ph:713.572.2900
 Fax:713.572.2902

Tax ID No: 76-0847361

July 7, 2017

JWY

Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending Cor
 P.O. Box 79766
 Houston, Texas 77279

Inv #: 16690

Client #: 101209

Matter #: 002006

Bill Through Date 06 /30/17

RE: Brunsting, Estate of Nelva E

DATE	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT	LAWYER
May-17-17	Prepare correspondence to Greg Lester on matter and review of opinion.	0.50	175.00	JWY
	Totals	0.50	<u>\$175.00</u>	
	Total Fee & Disbursements			<u>\$175.00</u>
	Previous Balance			10,445.73
	Balance Now Due			<u>\$10,620.73</u>

FEE SUMMARY

JWY	\$350.00	0.50	\$175.00
-----	----------	------	----------

COPY