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FILED 
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Stan Stanart 
County Clerk 

Harris County 

ESTATE OF 

fl VA E. BRUNSTING, 

DECEASED 

o. 412,249 

§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 

Harris County - County Probate Court No 4 

IN fi lE PROBATE COURT 

NUMBER FOUR ( 4) OF 

HARRIS COUNTY, TEXAS 

APPLICATION FOR PAYMENT OF ATTORNEY'S FEES AND EXPENSES 
FOR THE PERIOD AUGUST l, 2015 THROUGH MAY 31,2017 

COMES NOW Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending Contest of the 

Estate of Nelva E. Brunsting, Deceased, ("Appl icanl''), by and through his counsel of record Jill 

W. Young, and tiles this his Application for Payment of Attorney's Fees and Expenses for the 

Period August I, 2015 Through May 31,2017. and for such relief would respectfully show the 

Court the following: 

2. 

Applicant was appointed Temporary Administrator Pending Contest of the Estate of 

Nelva E. Brunsting, Deceased, by Order of this Court signed on July 23, 2015. Applicant 

qualified as such on July 24, 2015, and has continued to serve in his Cow1 appointed capacity at 

a ll times since his date of qualification. 

3. 

Pursuant to this Court· s Order Granting Authority to Retain Counsel dated September l 0, 

2015, and pursuant to Section 352.051 of the Texas Estates Code, Applicant engaged the law 

firm of Macintyre, McCuJloc~ Stanfield & Young, LLP, with offices ar 2900 Weslayan, Suite 

150, Ilouston, Texas 77027, who have rendered necessary legal services and/or advanced 

necessary expenses on behalf of Appl icant \vith respect to the Estate of Nelva E. Brunsting, 

Deceased. By reason of such employment. Applicant is indebted to the law firm of Macintyre, 

McCulloch, Stanfie ld & Young, LLP for legal services rendered to and expenses advanced on his 
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behalf fo r the period of August I, 2015 Through May 31 , 2017. Such legal services and 

expenses are set forth in detailed monthly statements which are attached to the Affidavit of Jill 

W. Young as Exhibit "A." 

4. 

All of the aforesaid fees and expenses were necessary and all of the fees and expenses 

were reasonable under all of the circumstances and were incurred in the representation of 

Applicant with respect to the Estate ofNelva E. Brunsting, Deceased. See Exhibit "A." 

5. 

Applicant requests this Court, after review and consideration, enter an Order that the total 

sum of $10,620.73 is equitable and just and should be taxed against and paid from the assets of 

tJ1e Ward' s Estate to Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield & Young, LLP for attomey's fees and 

expenses for the period of August l , 2015 Through May 31 , 2017. See TEX. ESTATES CODE 

§1155.054. 

WHEREFORE, PREMISES CONSIDERED, Applicant prays that (i) the Court enter an 

Order approving the fees and expenses incurred by Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield & Young, 

LLP on behalf of Applicant; (ii) the Court authorize Applicant's fees and expenses in the total 

amount of $10,620.73 as being equitable and just and should be paid from the assets of the 

Estate; and (iii) the Court grant Applicant such other and further relief as he may show himself 

justly entitled to receive. 



I I 

Respectfully submitted, 

MaciNTYRE, McCULLOCH, STANFIELD 
& YOUNG. LLP 

· ll.young@mmlav.rtexas.c 
State Bar No. 00797670 
2900 Wcslayan, Suite 1 SO 
Houston, Texas 77027 
(713) 572-2900 
(713) 572-2902 (Fax) 

A ITORNEYS FOR APPLICANT 



ESTATE OF 

NEL VA E. BRUNSTING, 

DECEASED 

THE STATE OF TEXAS 

COUNTY OF HARRIS 

NO. 412,249 

§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 

IN THE PROBATE COURT 

NUMBER FOUR (4) OF 

HARRIS COUNTY, TEXAS 

ATTORNEY FEE AFFIDA VlT 

§ 
§ 
§ 

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, on this day personally appeared Jill W. Young, 

the Affiant, who after being by me duly sworn, does state: (1) that Affiant is a duly licensed and 

practicing attorney in the state of Texas with offices in Houston, Han-is County, Texas; (2) that 

Affiant and her law firm, Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield & Young, LLP have been hired by 

Applicant to represent her in the administration of the above entitled guardianship proceeding; 

(3) that a true and conect copy of the Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield & Young, LLP's firm 

profile and attorneys' resumes showing their qualifications for the type of work involved in this 

case is attached as Exhibit "Al" to this Affidavit filed herein; (4) that Affiant and her law fi rm, 

Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield & Young, LLP, have performed the Jegal services which are 

described in detai l and attached as Exhibit "A2" to this Affidavit filed herein and states that 

such services were properly and timely performed on behalf of Applicant; (5) that all legal 

services, hours worked, and expenses that are detailed in the attached statements were necessary 

and all fees and expenses for the work and services rendered were reasonable and rendered on 

behalf of Applicant; (6) that the fees and expenses included in this Application cover the time 

period of August I , 20 15 Through May 31, 2017 in the amount of $10,620.73; (7) that the 

invoices attached hereto as Exhibit "A2" represent fees and expenses presently due and owing to 

EXHIBIT~ A\( ----



Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield & Young, LLP in the amount of$ I 0,620.73 for the time period 

August I, 2015 Through May 31 , 2017; (8) that all just and legal offsets, payments, credits and 

professional discounts provided to the client and known to the Affiant have been allowed and are 

reflected in the attached statements; (9) that any fees and expenses of legal assistants were done 

under the direction and supervision of an attorney; and (1 0) that Affiant has made and presented 

this Application and Affidavit to the Court with notice to all parties. 

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED by said JILL W. YOUNG, before me, the 
undersigned authority, on this 3rd day of October, 2017. 

'"'""'tt. NOOEA CAMillE EGGINS 
'" _... """''' T s t'ii····~<t.\ Notorv Puollc. Slole ot exo 

; • : ..... ) ;,§ Comm. expires 03·06-2020 
~~:~·o;·~~! NOIOIY 10 \2643&400 ,,,., .,,\\: 



Firm Profile - MacLntyre, McCulloch, Stanfield, and Young, L.L.P. 

1111MF 

MMS&Y 
~I.\( INTYRI:.· :\1.:-Cl'LLOt H ·S 1.·\NI:'II·LP·'t'lllJM, 

FIRM PROFILE PR1\CT!CE. ARl~AS A 1TO IOH:YS NF.WS CONTACT 

The attorneys M Macintyre, McCul loch, Stanfield, Y01mg, L.L.P. deliver leg;~ I Sl'tvk<!l' til n wid~ range of busine..-;s 

and indhiduol clients: finnnciallnstitutions itwolved in or with intt-ffi-1' in the di.~position of wills. tntsM and 

~~1ah~: individual trust beneficiaries, as well a~ corpornte fiducitnic~. in their respective t-olcs a• gu.1rdians, 

tmstecs, administrators aTKt;or executors of trusts and estates; individu:~ls "ithin n family ~ct'ldng n'J)rcsf.'ntntion 

in cout1 or assistMee "ith estate planning or administrntion; and husineo;.o:e..~ and execuriws seeking 

rcprt$1!ntation nr coun.<:el in a civil litigation matter. 

SF.NSJTIVI! 111A1TERS 

The issues in thes.e matters are sensitive: protecting ao;sef~ lhlltmay ha\'e tnl<cn ~lifetime to ncc-umt~atc; 

managing property that has heen in the fainily for gen~.Jtions: moking long rnnge provi!'ions for bencliciarics; 

protecting business interests from dL~putes ~nd other threats.TI1ese nre mutters tllal can affect personal ru; well 

ns financial >velll>cing. 

We u11d~rstand this and str·ive to assist our clients with the whole SL'Opc of I he issues they fact:. We are lawyers 

you <~m talk to. 

Page 1 of2 
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Fim1 Profile - Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield, and Young, L.L.P. 

w~ 11n~l "~lh scll!>iti,-ity and the force necessary to achicvc our diem.~· gools. W1• n.-.lii.t ln pr~uting and 

ckftnding '~tll contests, ,,ilJ and trust construction. ttrmin<~tion of ln~111, R''if,n;Jtlon or n>m0\111 of trustees, 

liti~<rtion Arising out oft he administration oi estate~ and trwt.<. as \'ell n.' gt'l\tral cwil malltl"ll, nnd also handle 

ell fonn< of alternative dispute ~ution. 

RetUII< nllrttrr. a.. do the ~ings and ~:nsimities of the pcoplt' we rcp~nt . We ·~·tr fo11tt'1 the 1mpon.anc:e of 

t-1~. 

Ef'Fl:.f11V£ SOLUTIONS 

Our nttorn¥ •evreSl'nt individual trust beneficmne~ as well liS I'OI'J'IOfnlt• ITdudurit"< 111 tl1e1r r!"'pt'ctJvc roles as 

g\101'\limL<, tn.lslC('S, ndministrotors. or exe<."lltor.s oftnJijiS nnd ~stult'11, lh.'C0\1'<' prob~t~. tnl~t~, Qnd .-stale;: 

liti~HtiOil i~ interdiSl'iplintH)'. clil'llts directly benefit 1lS 1l resuh of C"lllr CX[ICI"irncc ill bu~inC:;s('l; tran~cthi11S. re.'\J 

cst.atc, M:curiLii.'S, employee benefit$, corporal!!, and tax, urnoa)g other urctt~. 

Our nt W111cy~ work to resolve the issues in a dispute ancl ochi()vc tlw ptrsonal ns w<~llll.q Rno ncial obj1!Ctivcs of 

our clients, c<1111hinit1J1 k.:cn onnb•sis. carefol prepani!Jon, pmctical skills. ond COIII I)rth~Jl$h·e e.'(pcrlcncc to 

rcprcst•IIL rlicnts cffe<:Livcly before judges, juries, a11d other arbit<'f!l, Jl' \,l' CIIMilt ·~~~~~·~ n ftl\'oruhle prc~trial 

~olution, we try c:l.Ses confidently and vigorous}~· to vecdic:t. 

.!900 We&lol)"liD. SUit(' ISO 

How.IOtl, Tc.'CIIl\ ":'70:17 

!>bone: 713·572·2900 

!'Ill(: ?13·572·2'10:1 

l:.mt~il: lnquiry@mmlowtexu.com 

Page 2 of2 
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LEGAL DISCLAIM ER 

http://www.mmlawtexas.com/firrn-profile/ 8/22/2017 



Jill Willard Young- Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield, and Young, L.L.P. 

MMS&Y 
MAt.'l :.JTYRI:. · McCl!LW CH · ::JTA.\IFTELD ·YOUNG 

HOME FT RM l'ROVfLE I'RAC"l'TCE ARE:\S ATTORNEYS RESOURCES CO'NT:\CT 

.JILL. WILLARD YOUNG 

Download V-Card 

BIOGIW'HY 

.Jill Willard Young has over 17 yC"<lrs of representing 

many different clients in both general civil litigation 

nnd probate litigation and has tticd cases to verdict in 

these ar~as of the law. Sh~ represents tru~iees, 

administrators, executors, beneficiaries and 

guardians in litigation con<:eming t rusts, wills, gifts. 

estates and guardianships. Ms. Young. also fcx:uses 

her practice on commercial litigation matters. She 

represents businesses and indi\iduals in disputes 

involving contraCt$, fraud, mis•·eprescntation. breach 

of fiduciary duty and administration litigation claillls 

im·olvi ng state and federal agencies. 

EDUCATION 

,J.D., 1996, South Te.xas College of Law 

http:/ /www.mmlawtexas. cornfj ill-willard-young/ 

REPRF.SENTATIVE MATfERS 

Represented se,·eral large corporate fidudaries in 

their respective roles as trustees, exewtors, andi<H' 

administrators of trusts nnd e.,<;tates as well as 

individuals in gual'dianship proceedings and \'31'iOus 

lawsuits related to wills, tmsts, and estates 

Represented cl ients in all t:--1>es of contested probate, 

trust nnd guardim;u;hip litigation through trial, 

sununaryjudgment, mediation and arbitration 

Represented seYeral Ja1oge corporations nnd 

indhoiduuls in matter' invol\'ing various contractual 

and bt1siness tort disputes, including fraud, 

misrepresentation, breach of fiduciary dut,v, and 

breach of contract through trial. summary judgm(•nt. 

mediation and arbit•·ation 

Repre.sented several large oil and gas companies in 

multiple litigations matters involving multiple parties 

in large complex commercial dispute..~ 

Represented numerou.s grocery store chains in 

administrative disputes "ith the State ofT.cxas 

through trial at the admini!;trati\'e level 

AWARDS & RECOGNITIONS 

Texas Rising Stars, Texas Monthly; 2004-

2006 

tvl'embe•·, State Bar of Texas; Litigation and 

Probate and Estate Sections 

Member. Houston 'Bar Association 

Member, College of the State Bar of Texas 

Mcmhc1·, Texas Young l.nwyers Association 

.Mernber, Disability and f!.lder Law At1orneys 

Association 

Member. AttomC'ys in Tt~x and Probate 

Summer Event Chai r. Te.xa' Exes Houston 

Chapter, 1999-2003 

Page 1 of3 
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Jill Willard Young - Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield, and YouJ1g, L.L.P. 

Nntion:ll Ordrr of the Barristers; 199<> 

l'l'J'i and IQQO Nauonal American Bar 

\NXiQiiun & Moot C.oul'\ Champion 

Alll<"ri'"m liar AN<oct .. tion Best Ad-ocate Awnrd, 1996 

Jotn,olil't, Arncric:\n 1l.u Asso<-iation National Mock 

)'rial C'.(JtllpClltion, 1996 

Nn titll1111 Appclloll.l Advocacy Champion 

t\mr oiran llMt' A~sociution. 1995 

Natlollni i'I J1J~~llntc Adv<>cocyChampion 

Amcrl~lln Rur A."So<:intion. 1991> 

Natlun31 Appellate Ach'OC;Icy, Best :\lhvcate ''"''llrd. 
1·)911 

II$ 191'19, Th~Unh-moityo(TexasatAustin 

A0~11SSIOSS 

Texas 

LI.S. Di~t. Ct .. 

F .. I>l~t. Tcxns 

U.~. DiN\. Ct., 

S. Olst. TrxM 

~00 We.,l,t)",tn, Suite 150 

Hou~tun, 'lexa.cc 770'./.7 

Phone: 71:'1·572·:.!900 

Fux: 7t:Ni72·21)02 

t·:mroil: lnqulty@mmlnwtcxll.~.com 

http://www.mmlawtexas.com/jiU-willard-young/ 

AurtJon Ch.tir "f>«p II\ the Ht~r1 of Texas.· 

T\'lC48Indepeuc!cn<'l' G.tla, .tOOO 

I'\ em Ch.1ir, 'Trot• F11tht." Tex:u 

lndcpcnd~olea I~ Cclchr .. non und Auction, 

:lOU I 

F.wnl Vic(' l'tt:Sidcmt, Tc'Cll.< f.xe.slfou;;on 

<.'h;)pu:r. 2on:1 

P~i«nl Fl\'\.1 lt"lm~ l.x<'5IIOI*ton Ch;apter. 

2(Klll·:l0t>:j 

Pr\~idt'lll, Tt'XM bt:.; llou:.ton O~:•pter, 

2003·20<).j 

1\rhohlr,:hip Ccmnnillt•e, n·xu~ r-.x~$ Jtouston 

l'hi.tJllCI', :Wil:l•f!I"'I:CIIl 

'II.:.'CM Exes llusi11c1<:< Nt•twork ,\.clvi.~IIJ'Y Bonrtl, 

:.cuO;I·IlrC•cnl 

llouo·d of nio·l' <~lt\1'6, The Unl\'c•·sity ni'Tcxas 

llcnlth ~>d,•cwi• Cunll'r. l l(llostc)ll, Te.'<us. :woa­

;~oo~ 

• r.omoniltel' M1•mbcr t'yatir f'ibro$ili 

h11111dat ic•n Sp<orl:! t'hnllcn~~:e 

t\cl]tu>c:-t f'mf~r. l'<mth re"--s Colley.e of Law 

1£<1\lr~r &nllh Tt'>(ll!l CoUrg.,. of La .. 

('ontlniiii'IV l.egl•ll:.ilile'Utum Pt~ 

Annu.\1 Fu11d Chodr nod Committ~. 

P~1.-rtMI &hool 

PRES£1\"fAO ONS 6. Pl*BLICATIONS 

'The hl~pol'fun.:~ t~f Kct'I''"K ltrcords in Litigation," 

pre.<·nto.'d lo prllpcrty llliiO·Ii\tl'lo c>f l'lng.<:hlp 

Pro~rtir Corvnrallnn, ;~m•.l 

"Sdectcd l~lll'!l l(dull.'<.l lu lliNQlmliflcntjon of 

Cmu~~tl," :JOO:j 

• First Yl.'lll' St•crtts: llc•w lo llc Gt•ocl Mentee ond a 

(i\)()() A-~dill(!," 2Clf1:)•21,C'l7 

"Tilr Tnnl of~ Will Conwst." South Tr.xJls Cnlley.c of 

1.1w, Will~ nnd l'ro\WI1 11l<t11Utc. :.1009 

"Du·C(·t F.x.otninBtlnn nl an K\'PI'rt." South Texas 

Coll!'ll.<' otl.o~w. :IUIQ, ~ntffi b'· Jill W. 'oung & 

.hmmv \\';,lkrr 
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Jill Willard Young - Maclntyre, McCulloch, Stanfield, and Young, L.L.P. 

·~ 2tH 7 M \C IN'n' RF. , MCC UI.I.C1C II STAJo:FIELD, & 
YO !;~G. I. l I' 

http://www.mmlawtexas.com/jill-willard-young/ 
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Adrianne Archer Graves - Macintyre, McCulloch, Stanfield, and Young, L.L.P. 

MMS&Y 
:~1.·v I~T\ RE X1cCLLl.<.IC I! I \Nl· IFI.D \UIJ:'Ii (, 

I'IRM I'ROFILF. ATIORNEYS Cfl1\T.\CT 

ADRlANNE A RCI1 £ R GRAVES 

Uownloud V·Curd 

BI()GRAI' TW 

Adri.um~ Archer Grnv<'S roc\•ses her practice on 

probate liti~lltinn, fiduciary lingation. and g(•nernl 

cMllitlAtltion. She also represents guardians, 

tn•,'tf<. ... ,Jdmini~imtor,;. and executa~ "ith 

admlnlStmti\'e 11\itttfl". Addition:illy, Mrs.. Grmei 

a..,..~St~ ch~.nu 10 e-t.ate planning matters. 

EOl'CA TION 

Ml'mbcr, Vhi l'lclta Ph1 

St. Mary·~ l.nw.Joumal. Editorial Board 

ll.A. , Texas Chlistian University, 2004 

REJ>R F$RNTATI'VR Mi\'TTRRS 

l'robute l.ltiJ,\llliun oud A<hnlnl~ll••lkm 

FiclnciHI)' l..lth;uttun 

Gu.u-dinn~ip lo;..<lll'-'1 nnd Utigatlon 

General Ci\11 l..itigntion 

F..~Mt' l'lannin!( 

\WARDS & RP.<'OCNITIONS 

Mtrnber. Stlltt' ll:.r 111 'l'~as· l'l'OI>:~t~. Tn!St 

~nd F<tute ScOlnn 

• Member, llnu>t~m Bar A't'iociution; l'robutc, 

1'1'1161 nnd F .. tule Sect lou 

Member, 'tcxasYl•tmg l.uwycr~ IIS$0<'iation 

Metnl~r. l lou~:um Youug IA1"1'<'r8 ASSociation 

Member, 1\ttcn·nr.~v In Tnx nnd l'robatc 

• MCt!lbc••, 1 hlltNlOI\ 'l'rtt$\~ unu ~~tatcs Cluh 

I' RJ'..SI·:NTATIONS & I'UDU CATIONS 

Co-Author, "Step Motl.'I1CrB und Stl!p Kids" 

Sooth T(!Xa.~ Culll"'\1' or 1.,..•"', 21113 

S~kcr/ Authnr, "I niti~lifll GlliirdiArllihip 

l'n»>W.n~~e~· 

Gu:udian and Anon~· Ad Litem C~fication 

Course, S<>tnh TC)CIJ. Colltl\1'0( l..Bw, 2012 

Spt-Jk.-r/ Author, •(;uardi.m .. hiJX A tn 7:' 

\\'ill8 and l'robatt IMIItlste, lloust.nn Bar Association. 

201!1 

Speaker, "llcl"··uderlt o\tlrum l'tr<~lillll front i\ to 7:' 

Will ~ ~nd I'• •>hat~ ln.;l!tutt•, llonslnn Hnr Aswcintion, 

201 1 

http://www.mmlawtexas.com/adrianne-archer-graves/ 
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Adrianne Archer Graves - Macl ntyre, McCulloch, Stan field, and Young, L.L.P. 

A 'OMISSIONS 

State Bar ofTtxaS 

t.: .S. Orstnn Coun, Southern Dlsrrict ofT~ 

:t<IOU Wl?~hl\-.10 Suit<' 150 

I fc>~hltm. Tt·lut> "'711~7 

l'iHilll'' 71:l·~72-::t900 

flmc: 7l~l·fli2·:t90:t 

Email: inq••ir-y@m•nluwtcKilS.cum 

"Re."llrlctln& T\clo: Will RecleAning Blight in Sc.'n1Jtt' 

Bill 71k the Ugh1u1 U1e t:n\1 of the 1\mnd")" 

St. \fnl)•'.s ~,.,,, Jnt•mal, :.!Uo6 

Page 2 of2 

Dll 
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Macintyre McCulloch Stanfield Young, LLP 
2900 Weslayan, Suite 150 
Housto~ Texas 77027 

Ph:713.572.2900 

Fax:7 13.572.2902 

Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending Cor 

P.O. Box 79766 
Houston, Texas 77279 

RE: Brunsting, Estate ofNelva E 

DATE DESCRIPTION 

Aug-31-15 Lengthy telephone conversation with Greg 
Lester, review various dockets in matter and 
documents forwarded by Mr. Lester. 

Sep-01-15 Receipt and review of correspondence; review 
orders; meeting with Greg Lester to discuss 
case and how to proceed; memo on documents 
that need to be prepared and filed. 

Obtained initial information on this matter 
from Jill Young. 

Sep-02-15 Memo on various items; review file; work on 
procedural matters including moving hearings 
and trial setting in district court; correspond 
regarding court hearings set and moving of 
trial date. 

Receipt and review of Order Appointing 
Temporary Administrator; attention to Entry of 
Appearance and Motion for Continuance; 
begin review of district court fii ings and 
attention to upcoming settings; telephone 
conversation with Neal Spielman; memo to 
file regarding same 

Sep-03-15 Review correspondence; update regarding 
same. 

Tax ID No: 76-0847361 

November 16, 2015 

JWY 
Inv #: 13157 

Client#: 

Matter#: 

Bill Through Date 

101209 

002006 

10/31/15 

HOURS AMOUNT LAWYER 

1.00 350.00 JWY 

1.70 595.00 JWY 

0.50 112.50 AAG 

1.70 595.00 JWY 

2.50 562.50 AAG 

0.20 70.00 JWY 

EXHIBIT ~ A~'' 



Invoice#: 13157 Page 2 November 16, 2015 

Draft Entry of Appearance and Motion for 1.20 270.00 AAG 
Continuance; review and revise same; receipt 
and review of memorandum regarding status 
and attention to hearing setting 

Sep-04-15 Correspondence to Greg Lester on status. 0.50 175.00 JWY 

Review and revise Motion for Continuance 0.70 157.50 AAG 
and Entry of Appearance and attention to 
setting to continue summary judgment in 
district cowt proceedings; receipt of 
memorandum to client; attention to hearing 
setting on Application to Retain Counsel and 
Notice regarding same 

Sep-08-15 Follow-up on Motion with Greg Lester and the 0.50 175.00 JWY 
hearing for application. 

Attention to upcoming hearing on Application 0.40 90.00 AAG 
to Retain Counsel and notice to COWlsel 
regarding same; receipt and review of call 
from Mr. Neal Spielman 

Sep-09-15 Telephone conversation with Neal Spielman; 0.80 180.00 AAG 
attention to hearing on Application to Retain 
Counsel; receipt and review of memorandum 
to Greg Lester; receipt and review of 
correspondence from opposing parties to 
Court; attention to Response filed to 
Application to Retain Counsel; conference 
with JHI Young 

Sep-10-15 Telephone caJJ and correspondence to Greg 0.20 70.00 JWY 
Lester regarding hearing and matter for Friday. 

Receipt and review of Response to Application 0.50 112.50 AAG 
to Retain Counsel; telephone conversation 
with Greg Lester; memorandum to Jill Young 

Sep-11-15 Receipt and review of Order Allowing 0.50 112.50 AAG 
Administrator to Retain Counsel; exchange of 
correspondence with Greg Lester; 
memorandwn to file regarding fee standards 

Sep-14-15 Review Order; conference regarding same; 0.50 175.00 JWY 
document review from client; advise Adri 
Graves on how to proceed. 

Sep-17-15 Receipt and review of correspondence from 0.80 280.00 JWY 
parties regarding pleadings; advise Adri 
Graves on plan for proceeding with the 
documents; correspondence to parties. 



Invoice#: 13157 Page 3 November 16, 2015 

Attention to compiling pleadings and 0.60 135.00 AAG 
documents received from counsel; draft 
correspondence to all counsel regarding 
litigation and requesting documents; docket 
deadlines for expiration of temporary 
administration and report deadlines 

Sep-18-1 5 Attention to pleadings for review of claims in 0.30 67.50 AAG 
this litigation 

Sep-21-15 Receipt and review of conespondence; 0.30 105.00 JWY 
respond to various emails. 

Sep-22-15 Review e-mail correspondence from party; 0.30 105.00 JWY 
finalize correspondence. 

Continue to review pleadings and pertinent 0.50 112.50 AAG 
discovery in District Court cause; receipt and 
review of chronology from Candace Curtis 

Sep-24-15 Receipt and review of correspondence and 0.80 280.00 JWY 
documents from parties in matter; initial 
review of documents; advise Adri on how to 
proceed and review of information. 

Receipt and review of correspondence and 0.20 45.00 AAG 
documents from Candace Curtis' legal 
assistant; 

Sep-25-15 Review relevant District Court pleadings, 1.50 337.50 AAG 
discovery and documents; prepare 
memorandum regarding same; attention to 
review of trust documents and identification of 
same 

Sep-28-15 Receipt and review of additional documents; 0.80 280.00 JWY 
telephone conversation with Bobbie Bayless 
regarding documents. 

Sep-29-15 Receipt and review of correspondence from 0.30 105.00 JWY 
parties; follow-up on same. 

Sep-30-15 Continue extensive review of Trust materials 2.40 540.00 AAG 
and prepare memorandums regarding same 

Oct-01-15 Receipt and review of correspondence. 0.20 70.00 JWY 

Oct-02-15 Continue extensive review of trust documents 3.00 675.00 AAG 
and pleadings asserting claims in this matter; 
review and revise memorandums regarding 
same 

Oct-14-15 Conference on documents; review additional 0.70 245.00 JWY 
correspondence. 



I ' 

Invoice#: 13157 

Nov-16-15 Professional discount 

Totals 

DISBURSEMENTS 

Sep-01-15 
Sep-04-15 

Photocopies 
eFiling with the court 
eFiling with the court 

Totals 

Page 4 

Total Fee & Disbursements 

Balance Now Due 

FEE SUMMARY 

JWY 

AAG 

$350.00 

$225.00 

10.50 

15.60 

I • 

$3,325.00 

$3,510.00 

November 16, 2015 

-350.00 

26.10 $6,835.00 

10.00 
6.17 
2.06 

$18.23 

JWY 

$6,853.23 

$6,853.23 



Macintyre McCulloch Stanfield Young, LLP 
2900 Weslayan, Suite 1 SO 

Houston, Texas 77027 

Ph:713.572.2900 

Fax:713.572.2902 
Tax ID No: 76-0847361 

Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending C01 

P.O. Box 79766 
Houston, Texas 77279 

RE: Brunsting, Estate ofNelva E 

DATE DESCRIPTION 

Dec-03-15 Review status of report for Mr. Lester; 
telephone call to Greg Lester on various 
topics; correspond regarding same. 

Dec-15-15 Continue to review pertinent trust documents 
and pleadings, revise and prepare 
memorandums 

Dec-16-15 Status update on report; correspond regarding 
same. 

Telephone conversation with Greg Lester; 
exchange of correspondence with Alec Covey 
regarding status; continue to review docwnents 
and prepare memorandums regarding same 

Dec-17-15 Attention to preparing documents for Greg 
Lester 

Dec-21-15 Receipt and review of message from Greg 
Lester; attention to scheduling meeting with 
Mr. Lester and preparation of memorandums 

Dec-22-15 Meeting with Greg Lester regarding report 

Dec-23-15 Continue to work on report and draft of same 

Dec-24-15 Continue to draft memo to Administrator for 
report 

Tnv #: 

Client#: 

Matter#: 

February 10, 2016 

JWY 

13598 

Bill Through Date 

101209 

002006 

01/31/16 

HOURS AMOUNT LAWYER 

0.80 280.00 JWY 

1.40 315.00 AAG 

0.30 105.00 JWY 

2.20 495.00 AAG 

0.20 45.00 AAG 

0.20 45.00 AAG 

0.50 112.50 AAG 

0.40 90.00 AAG 

0.50 112.50 AAG 



Invoice#: 13598 Page 2 February 10, 2016 

Dec-28-15 Continue to work on Brunsting memorandum 3.00 675.00 AAG 
for Temporary Administrator 

Jan-04-16 Continue to review and revise memorandum 0.70 157.50 AAG 
regarding evaluation of claims for Temporary 
Administrator 

Jan-05-16 Continue to review pleadings filed in both the 1.80 405.00 AAG 
Probate and District Court case; review and 
revise memorandum to Temporary 
Adminsitrator regarding claims; telephone 
conversation with Temporary Administrator 
and correspondence to same enclosing draft 
memorandums 

Jan-11-16 Review of draft memo for report; follow-up on 0.80 280.00 JWY 
same. 

Draft cotTespondence to Greg Lester; receipt 1.20 270.00 AAG 
and review of message from Mr. Lester; 
review No Contest Clause provisions in Trust 
Agreements and documents; telephone 
conversation with Mr. Lester regarding same 

Jan-18-16 Receipt and review of filed Report of 0.40 90.00 AAG 
Temporary Administrator 

Jan-19-16 Status conference regarding filing of Report; 0.20 70.00 JWY 
correspond regarding various topics. 

Jan-21-16 Telephone conversation with Neal Spielman 0.20 45.00 AAG 
regarding Temporary Administrator's Report 
and potential mediators 

Totals 14.80 $3,592.50 

Total Fee & Disbursements $3,592.50 
Previous Balance 6,853.23 

Balance Now Due $10,445.73 

FEE SUMMARY 

JWY $350.00 2.10 $735.00 

AAG $225.00 12.70 $2,857.50 



Macintyre McCulloch Stanfield Young, LLP 
2900 Weslayan, Suite 150 

Houston. Texas 77027 

Ph:713.572.2900 
Fax:713.572.2902 

Tax ID No: 76-0847361 

Gregory A. Lester, Temporary Administrator Pending Cor 
P.O. Box 79766 
Houston, Texas 77279 

RE: Brunsting, Estate ofNelva E 

DATE DESCRIPTION 

May-17-17 Prepare correspondence to Greg Lester on 
matter and review of opinion. 

Totals 

Total F ee & Disbursements 

Previous Balance 

Balance Now Due 

FEE SUMMARY 

JWY $350.00 0.50 

Inv #: 

Client #: 

Matter #: 
Bi ll Through Date 

July 7, 2017 

JWY 

16690 

101209 

002006 
06/30/17 

HOURS AMOUNT LAWYER 

0.50 175.00 

0.50 $175.00 

$175.00 

JWY 

$175.00 
10,445.73 

$10,620.73 


